
Time for a Justice Stacl< 
Need to work on technology-driven presence-Jess, 
paperless, and consent-based justice delivery 

CHAllENGES IN MANY of our key gov­
ernance and justice delivery componmts 
are well-k-nown and well-documented. 
Addressing them, however, required 
mindset shifts and the development of 
long-tenn solutions. Howjustilr delivery 
can be made more accessible,cff ldmt and 
affordable is a key issuc.A 360-degrec 
solution-set that helpson-board technol­
ogyto bring ease of access tojusticciscrit­
ically important. 

An excellent segue from the current 
scenario into one of technology as an buc­
gral part of justice delivery is laid out by 
draft Vision document for Phase 3 by the 
Supreme Courtoflndia'se-Committce.lt 
is a progressive, tech-forward framework 
that sets the foundation for what could 
eventually be a comprehensive technol­
ogy stack. !lased along the lines of the 
India Stackand,fmtherdown~tream, the 
National Health Stack and the Unified 
Payment Interface (UP I), d1c proposed jus­
tice stack could help enable a variety of 
diverse functions. Built as a "Common 
Public Good~ it would a wid duplication 
of efforts and help achieve systemic con­
vergence towards citizen-centric gover­
nance.Essentially,Jike in several other sec­
tors in India, the time might now be ripe 

to work on a technology stack for justice 
towards a presence-less, paperless, cash­
less and consent-based justice delivery. 

Rooted in the principles of Data 
Empowerment and Protection Architec­
ture (OEPA), the stack would empower 
individuals to havecontrolovertheir per­
sonaldataand theextenttowhichexter­
nal agencies may have access to this data. 
Thegoalsoffinancial inclusion,caseofliv­
ing and ease of doing business are 
inevitably b1ter-twined with ease of access 
to justice. Strong data governance coupled 
with a stronger consent framc\Vork will 
ensure their realisation. There have 
already been several forays made into 
using technology for enhanced conve­
nience, access and efficiency across the 
judiciary. Therefore, through an inte­
gratl!d framework that relies on a feder­
ated ard1 itectme and essential building 
block.o;, the justice stack, through consen­
sus, can help several key areas become 
accessible and addressable. 

A layered, fcdcratedarchitecture that 
uses unbundled component~ called 
'building blocks', is tied together by 
intcroperablcstandardsintoacommon 
technology stack. This is available via 
micro -services and APis for shifting 
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benefits to the common man and 
increasing access to justice. To 
strengthen this and drive greater adop­
tion, a set of reference solutions and 
apps via innovation sandboxes may be 
made available, while ensuring courts' 
autonomy and data guardrails. 

A federated a rchitcctu re will help 
ensure the security and privacy of per­
sonal and sensitive information without 
compromising on intcropcrabiUty,tech­
nological flexibility, independence and 
compatibilitywith legacy systems.A fed­
erated architecture at the base level is 
modular in nature, and thus allows ew­
lution as technology advances. Also, by 
allowing each administrative level to 
maintaingradesof autonomy, it operates 
collaboratively,balancingorganlsational 
autonomy with ecosystem need s. The 
central architecture can focus on the 
dynamics of economics of scale, stan­
dards,intcroperabUityand commonality 
requirements, while the constinaent 
units' architectures have the flexibility to 
pursue autonomous strategies and i nde­
pendent processes. 

The 'building blocks'fonn the basis 
of a loosely coupled 'need-to-connect 
basis' framework, which helps unify the 

federated architecture into a holistic, 
solution-providing interface. To 
enhance efficiency, ensure data con sis· 
tency, intcroperability and enable 
natiooal portability,onlythe minimlllll 
required number of building blocks are 
designed,devclopcd,opcnsourccd,hcld 
and managed centrally. 

Within the building blockoptions/cat­
cgories that should be identified for the 
justice stack envisioned, some arc imme­
diatclyidentifiable as foundation tools for 
the possible rollout.These indude-infra­
stnlcturc ,interopcrabUity standards and 
specifications, federated identities, reg­
istries and reference data, sandboxes, 
asslstive technology,governance,fwance, 
administration,lcaming. and analyt ics. 
Spccificbuildingblocks underthesecate­
gories can helpcreatl!arcusable,intcrop­
erable set of units that can be deployed 
across all level~ of d1e judicial ecosystem 
of the country. With the positive and 
proactive approach ofdlc SC e-Conunit­
tec, d1e kt>y initiativesofthelawministry, 
and workbcingdoncin areas sud! as vir­
tual courts and Online Dispute Resolu­
tion, this is the righttimc to start thinking 
seriously about the designing and build­
ing of a fusticeStack. 
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